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A young girl fleeing Hitler takes refuge in Shanghai, where she learns that she must fight to survive

Throughout tomboy Ilse’s childhood, her mother has tried to force her to behave like a proper Austrian lady.
But when Hitler annexes their country, the family flees, boarding a packed freighter and sailing around the
world in search of a safe harbor. The United States refuses to take them, so they proceed to China and make
a new home in steamy, mysterious Shanghai. Their lodgings are cramped, money is tight, and Ilse’s father
cannot find work—but Ilse is enchanted by the city’s international flavor. In Shanghai’s shadows she finds
the adventure of a lifetime.
 
When the Japanese occupy the city, Ilse and her brother begin working in an underground resistance cell.
Each day, the city grows more dangerous, and Ilse must lie, cheat, and steal in order for her family to eat.
She is a long way from Austria, but she will do whatever it takes to survive.
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From reader reviews:

Ryan Pearson:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book entitled Shanghai Shadows? Maybe
it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's
book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different opinion?

Kathleen Strickland:

This Shanghai Shadows book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you get by reading this book is definitely information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get
data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This particular Shanghai
Shadows without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in pondering and analyzing.
Don't end up being worry Shanghai Shadows can bring if you are and not make your carrier space or
bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This
Shanghai Shadows having great arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not experience
uninterested in reading.

Richard Bennett:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their ability
in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of them is this Shanghai
Shadows.

Roy Taylor:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Shanghai Shadows reserve written by
well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who read
the book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate
your own personal hunger then you still question Shanghai Shadows as good book not just by the cover but
also by content. This is one publication that can break don't determine book by its include, so do you still
needing a different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so
why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.
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