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The Inn at Eagle Point
It’s been years since Abby O’Brien Winters set foot in Chesapeake Shores. The Maryland town her father
built has too many sad memories and Abby too few spare moments, thanks to her demanding Wall Street
career, the crumbling of her marriage, and energetic twin daughters. Then one panicked phone call from her
youngest sister brings her racing back home to protect Jess’s dream of renovating the charming Inn at Eagle
Point. But saving the inn from foreclosure means dealing not only with her own fractured family, but also
with Trace Riley, the man Abby left ten years ago. Trace can be a roadblock to her plans…or proof that
second chances happen in the most unexpected ways.

Flowers on Main
When her last two plays are dismal failures and her relationship with her temperamental mentor falls apart,
writer Bree O’Brien abandons Chicago and the regional theater where she hoped to make a name for herself
to return home. Opening Flowers on Main promises to bring her a new challenge and a new kind of
fulfillment. But not all is peaceful and serene in Chesapeake Shores, with her estranged mother on the scene
and her ex-lover on the warpath. Jake Collins has plenty of reasons to want Bree out of his life, but none of
those are a match for the one reason he wants her to stay: he’s still in love with her. Jake might be able to get
past that old hurt if he knew Bree was home to stay, but is she? The only way to know for sure is to take a
dangerous leap of faith.

Harbor Lights
Struggling in his role as a newly single father, former army medic Kevin O’Brien moves home to
Chesapeake Shores. He wants a haven for himself and his toddler son, surrounded by the family he knows he
can count on, and a future that’s nothing like his past. But Kevin is suddenly facing a risk he hadn’t
anticipated, in the form of Main Street bookseller Shanna Carlyle. Shanna immediately recognizes Kevin as
a wounded soul?she’s had way too much experience with the type. Still, this charming O’Brien man and his
son are almost impossible to resist. Then, just when the barriers are toppling, someone from Shanna’s past
appears. Confronted with a threat to their hard-won serenity, Kevin and Shanna face their toughest
challenge?learning to trust again.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Edick:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Sherryl Woods - Chesapeake Shores: Books 1-
3: The Inn at Eagle Point, Flowers on Main, Harbor Lights (Chesapeake Shores Series) guide written by
well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who
also read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill
only for eliminate your own hunger then you still question Sherryl Woods - Chesapeake Shores: Books 1-3:
The Inn at Eagle Point, Flowers on Main, Harbor Lights (Chesapeake Shores Series) as good book but not
only by the cover but also by content. This is one publication that can break don't judge book by its deal
with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense
already said so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Frank Lantz:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Sherryl Woods - Chesapeake Shores: Books 1-3:
The Inn at Eagle Point, Flowers on Main, Harbor Lights (Chesapeake Shores Series) was colorful and of
course has pictures around. As we know that book Sherryl Woods - Chesapeake Shores: Books 1-3: The Inn
at Eagle Point, Flowers on Main, Harbor Lights (Chesapeake Shores Series) has many kinds or category.
Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe
that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers you
feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading this.

Christina Webb:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or to make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit or real their
pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Sherryl Woods - Chesapeake Shores: Books 1-3: The Inn at Eagle Point, Flowers on
Main, Harbor Lights (Chesapeake Shores Series) can make you truly feel more interested to read.

Jose Garcia:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a guide. They are directly felt it when they get a
half portions of the book. You can choose the actual book Sherryl Woods - Chesapeake Shores: Books 1-3:
The Inn at Eagle Point, Flowers on Main, Harbor Lights (Chesapeake Shores Series) to make your current
reading is interesting. Your skill of reading proficiency is developing when you just like reading. Try to
choose easy book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the feeling about book and examining



especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide open a book and examine it. Beside that the e-book
Sherryl Woods - Chesapeake Shores: Books 1-3: The Inn at Eagle Point, Flowers on Main, Harbor Lights
(Chesapeake Shores Series) can to be your brand new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in
doing what must you're doing of the time.
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