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A rare glimpse into an artist's mind, his toolbox, and the world of film animation The Sweater is one of
the most beloved animated films of all time. Based on Roch Carrier's short story, also known as ''The
Hockey Sweater,'' the film recounts the most horrifying moment of the author's childhood. Sheldon Cohen
adapted the story into animation and created a film that is as much about childhood emotions and the desire
to fit in, as it is about hockey, the clash of cultures, and a harkening to bygone times. Now 30 years later,
Sheldon delves into his notebooks, photographs, and memories to recreate the process he undertook to make
The Sweater. He takes the reader on a journey back to Ste. - Justine, showing all of the places and people
that inspired him. He also delves into his other films, book illustrations, and paintings over his 40 - year
career, and along the way he gives us rich insights into the creative process.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Laureano:

The book This Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art with the Animator and
Illustrator of the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the good thing like a book This Sweater
Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art with the Animator and Illustrator of the
Hockey Sweater (Large Prin? Several of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim which book
can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge
or information that you take for that, you could give for each other; you could share all of these. Book This
Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art with the Animator and Illustrator of
the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and large function for
you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Jessica Hodgkins:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important normally. The book This Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process
in Film and Art with the Animator and Illustrator of the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin has been making you to
know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The
e-book This Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art with the Animator and
Illustrator of the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin is not only giving you much more new information but also to
get your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your guide. Try to make
relationship with all the book This Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art
with the Animator and Illustrator of the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin. You never experience lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Rhonda Silva:

The book This Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art with the Animator and
Illustrator of the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin will bring that you the new experience of reading a new book.
The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to learn, this book very
appropriate to you. The book This Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art
with the Animator and Illustrator of the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin is much recommended to you to see.
You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Marvin Ober:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to



share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended to
you personally is This Sweater Is for You!: Celebrating the Creative Process in Film and Art with the
Animator and Illustrator of the Hockey Sweater (Large Prin this e-book consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The language
styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some study when he
makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.
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