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A rollicking Sword & Sorcery Fantasy adventure.

Warrior born, warrior bred, Sir Danic of Drakehorn has faced death, capture, dismemberment, and torture,
but he is not prepared for this curse — trapped inside the body of a beautiful elfmaid!

Now she, as Danica, has one goal in life: hunt down and force the mage that traded bodies with her to switch
them back. Her biggest problem might be the big, vicious world she lives in. A world of meddling gods,
rogue mages and even wilder warriors is between Danica and her goal. With sword in hand, and
determination in her heart, she traverses the savage steppes and desert to find the one talisman that might
help her achieve victory. But is that what the gods want?

The Elfmaid Trilogy:
The Elfmaid's Curse
Into Lands Forbidden
Way of the Warrior

About the Author:
Warren Thomas is an IT professional by day, and a dreamer by night. While serving a tour of duty with the
Army in Germany, he found himself in daily contact with castles, cathedrals, and city walls. His imagination
erupted, and he's been writing fantasy adventures ever since.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Rice:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. We all know
that that book is very important for all of us. The book The Elfmaid's Curse (The Elfmaid Trilogy Book 1)
ended up being making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It
is very advantages for you. The guide The Elfmaid's Curse (The Elfmaid Trilogy Book 1) is not only giving
you more new information but also to get your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your current
spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship together with the book The Elfmaid's Curse (The
Elfmaid Trilogy Book 1). You never experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

Laura McCallum:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as well
as playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the entire day to reading
a reserve. The book The Elfmaid's Curse (The Elfmaid Trilogy Book 1) it doesn't matter what good to read.
There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. In the event you
did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read
this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book offers high quality.

Toni Sargent:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its handle may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer can be The Elfmaid's Curse (The Elfmaid Trilogy Book 1) why
because the great cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you. The
inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide
you to pick up this book.

Chester Brown:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. Therefore you know
that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important and book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except your own
teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous books that can
you choose to use be your object. One of them is The Elfmaid's Curse (The Elfmaid Trilogy Book 1).
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