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AT LAST THE HERO!

In the final book of the These Foolish Things Trilogy, Phil and the gang are back, and maybe this time he’ll
be a real hero.

Earth is under threat from an AI that has gone suddenly all Orwellian, and from a race of genocidal
mushrooms who have a real problem with the number of legs we have.

Somehow Phil, with his onboard AI and his new super-ripped muscles has to save the world from this double
threat, and see that Mille gets the justice she so richly deserves.

With a cameo appearance from Strange, and a deranged appearance from Mrs. Masters (Ex), the final book
in this science fiction comedy series takes Phil further from his comfy chair than he has ever been.

If he should succeed, against all the odds, then perhaps, when he stands erect and heroic above his fallen
enemies, there may even be a chance of an exotic love interest.

Follow Phil as he takes on light-sabre wielding robots and squishy aliens; as he attempts to bend an alien
court to his will, despite not understanding a single sqawk they say.

Will Phil emerge as the hero he always wanted to be?

Will gorgeous women flock to him with love in their eyes and lust in their hearts?

Will he be found hiding in a dark corner with his eyes closed and his fingers in his ears, waiting for the world
to go away and leave him alone?

With a bonus ‘Origins’ short story, and an excerpt from the Narrative Facilitator’s Pixie epic.

Don't miss this last chance to laugh with Phil.

CATEGORIES:

Science Fiction Comedy, First Contact, Comedy thriller, Comedy Mystery Books for Kindle, Science Fiction
Books for Adults, Science Fiction and Fantasy Series, Comedy Novels. Science Fiction Comedy Series,
General Humor.
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From reader reviews:

Alice Christensen:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book Nobody Puts a Fool in a Corner: A Science Fiction
Comedy (These Foolish Things Book 3). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. As long
as we know about how is important any book Nobody Puts a Fool in a Corner: A Science Fiction Comedy
(These Foolish Things Book 3). You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by just a
book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can know everything! From your country right up
until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you can know that. In
this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when
you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's learn.

Vincent Ashworth:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the name Nobody Puts a Fool in
a Corner: A Science Fiction Comedy (These Foolish Things Book 3) suitable to you? The particular book
was written by well known writer in this era. The actual book untitled Nobody Puts a Fool in a Corner: A
Science Fiction Comedy (These Foolish Things Book 3)is a single of several books in which everyone read
now. This book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new
shape that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in the simple way, thus all of people can
easily to recognise the core of this book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this
world now. So you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Arthur Sanchez:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get great
deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book
you have read is actually Nobody Puts a Fool in a Corner: A Science Fiction Comedy (These Foolish Things
Book 3).

Audrey Mack:

The book untitled Nobody Puts a Fool in a Corner: A Science Fiction Comedy (These Foolish Things Book
3) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The
language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read
this. The book was compiled by famous author. The author will bring you in the new time of literary works.
It is possible to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the
book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their



official web-site and also order it. Have a nice read.
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