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A remote location, isolated lake house, an irresistible property manager, a journey of passion and desire...it
all begins at Silver Lake. Kathryn Morgan's agent Lenore Tanner is ecstatic over the sale of her latest book
and the publisher's request for a sequel. Kathryn writes the wonderfully moving stories of love and passion
that have captivated America, but after writing five bestsellers in the past six years, Kathryn is exhausted and
desperately needs a vacation. Lenore offers Kathryn her lake house at Silver Lake for a month of rest, and
upon arrival, her life changes forever when she encounters a devastatingly handsome, mysterious, and
charismatic stranger. As Kathryn begins a perilous journey toward destiny with Marcus Blake, will they
survive the danger and mystery they face in search of true and lasting love; or fall victim to the swirling
intrigue surrounding them and Silver Lake?
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From reader reviews:

Alice Myers:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book allowed Silver Lake? Maybe it is
being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Jose Lloyd:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get lot of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got when
the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read is
usually Silver Lake.

Robert Mills:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Silver Lake which is having the
e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.

Kathryn Hebert:

You will get this Silver Lake by go to the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it could possibly
to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various.
Not only through written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era
just like now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your own personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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